To: Page, Jim[/O=ORIGIN-IT/OU=USEXCH/CN=SEMA/CN=JPAGE]
From: Cyran, Mark

Sent: Thur 4/28/2005 12:39:07 PM

Subject: RE: Dallas County

Jim,
Amy has us on an 8:30 flight.

Mark

From: Page, Jim

Sent: Thursday, April 28, 2005 6:42 AM
To: Cyran, Mark

Cc: Stewart, Paul

Subject: FW: Dallas County

Mark,

The meeting with Kathy Nealy at 9AM is confirmed. I'll let Vanessa and
Chris know we have something scheduled.

regards,

-——--Original Message-——--

From: Kathy Nealy [mailto:kathy_nealy@msn.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 27, 2005 8:54 PM

To: Page, Jim

Subject: Re: Dallas County

Yes, | will make myself available for a meeting on Friday, at 9am.

----- Original Message --—-

From: Page, Jim

Sent: Wednesday, April 27, 2005 2:44 PM
To: 'Kathy Nealy'

Subject: RE: Dallas County

Kathy,
Are you available for a meeting to discuss on Friday morning, April 29th

at 9:00am. I will fly to Dallas and meet you in the Atos Origin area if it's
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ok with you. Hoping to hear the results of your discussions with the
Commissioner.

Thank you.

From: Kathy Nealy [ mailto:kathy_nealy@msn.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 27, 2005 7:01 AM

To: Page, Jim

Subject: Re: Dallas County

FYl
Article in yesterday's Dallas Morning News referencing ATOS. | met with
Commissioner. He i$ trying to gather information to assess the situation. You,

Chris and | should talk asap. They county is looking to bring in an outside
consultant.

Kathy
—-—- Original Message —-
From: Page, Jim
Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2005 7:57 AM

To: 'Kathy Nealy'
Subject: RE: Dallas County

Thank you very much.

Yesterday, I received and approved your latest invoice dated April
4, 2005.

thanks,
From: Kathy Nealy [mailto:kathy_nealy@msn.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 20, 2005 8:59 PM
To: Page, Jim
Subject: Re: Dallas County
Jim,

| am trying to schedule a meeting with Commissioner Price within the next
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week.

Kathy

Will keep you informed.

- Original Message -—

From: Page, Jim

Sent: Wednesday, April 20, 2005 10:50 AM
To: 'Kathy Nealy'

Subject: RE: Dallas County

Kathy,

Thanks for talking yesteday. I have confirmed the
Kwanzafest invoice has been authorized for payment. Am
making further inquires as to whether the check has been
written.

Do you have any recommendations regarding further actions I
should be taking pertaining to the issues raised in your email.

thank you.

From: Kathy Nealy [mailto:kathy_nealy@msn.com]
Sent: Friday, April 15, 2005 1:03 AM

To: Page, Jim

Subject: Dallas County

Jim,

Just wanted to update you on Dallas County. We are being
dragged into the AIS controversy. Also, there are concerns
regarding Oracle. As you know, the county has a new CIO and he
is hearing a lot of negative comments as it relates to ATOS. Your
comments are appreciated

Kathy Nealy

Kathy L. Nealy & Associates
1211 Willow Glen

Dallas, TX 75232

(214) 374-2878

(214) 3740715 fax
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